Card-Lock and Fuel Delivery Services Bid Results

Card-Lock Services Pazin Pinnacle Petroleum SC Fuels Tesei
Card Lock Commodit Fuel Commoditv | Average Annual Gallons. | FIRM DIFFERENTIAL PRICING | FIRM DIFFERENTIAL PRICING | FIRM DIFFERENTIAL PRICING | FIRM DIFFERENTIAL PRICING
v v & PER GALLON PER GALLON PER GALLON PER GALLON
Card-Lock Unleaded Unleaded 157,000 No Bid No Bid S 0.121]$ 0.09
Card-Lock Clear Diesel Clear Diesel 11,000 No Bid No Bid S 0.121]$ 0.09
Card-Lock Dyed Diesel Dyed Diesel 300 No Bid No Bid S 012 $ 0.09
DIESEL Total Tax Fees No Bid No Bid S 042]$ 0.41
GAS Total Tax Fees No Bid No Bid S 053]$ 0.53
Fuel Delivery Services Pazin Pinnacle Petroleum SC Fuels Tesei
Fuel Tank Locations Fuel Tank Size Fuel Tvoe Averaze Annual Gallons_ | F'RM DIFFERENTIAL PRICING | FIRM DIFFERENTIAL PRICING | FIRM DIFFERENTIAL PRICING | FIRM DIFFERENTIAL PRICING
P & PER GALLON PER GALLON PER GALLON PER GALLON
Public Works Corp Yard, 1776 |3 - 12,000 gallon USTs (11630 2- Clear Diesel 210,000 $ 003[$ 0.08 No Bid $ 0.05
Grogan Ave. gal @100% full) 1- Dyed Diesel 800 $ 003 s 1.00 No Bid $ 0.05
Fire Station 51, 1 - Split tank Convault Clear Diesel 12,000 $ 0095 0.29 No Bid $ 0.10
th
99 E. 16" Street (1500 & 500 gal) Unleaded (87 ctane) 2,000 $ 007] s 0.79 No Bid $ 0.10
Fire Station 53
' 1- 500 gal Convault Clear Diesel 3,000 0.09 0.71 No Bid 0.10
800 Loughborough Dr gal Lonvau ear Diese ! 3 $ Bl $
WWTP 10260, 1- 5000 gal Convault Clear Diesel 12,000 S 0.05|$ 0.17 No Bid S 0.10
Gove Rd.
;gg;ﬁff;josr;s Ave 1- 500 gal Convault Clear Diesel 2,500 $ 009 ¢ 0.39 No Bid s 0.10
i:g;:ﬁ'cc;"ns\;’ay 1- 500 gal Convault Clear Diesel 2,500 $ 009 ¢ 0.50 No Bid s 0.10
DIESEL Total Tax Fees| $ 039 | $ 0.78 No Bid $ 0.39
GAS Total Tax Fees| S 0511|$S 1.02 No Bid S 0.51




